
Deposit Bonus



Bonus is applied by your account manager, once the funds are credited, the amount of the
deposit together with the bonus will be credited to your account. There is no limit on the
number of deposits to which the bonus can be applied.

2. 2. The amount depends on the shares, which take place in the company.

3) Bonus can be used for real trading, for increasing leverage and for taking advantage of
successful trading situations at full power. Bonus is not subject to any restrictions during
trading.

4. Bonus cannot be lost during trading. If the equity on your account becomes equal to or
lower than the bonus, the bonus will be deducted from your account. We are not responsible
for possible losses in that case.

5. The deposit bonus is intended to increase trading activity. The bonus will be deducted
from your account after one year, if not used in full by then.

6. In the case of withdrawals from the account, including internal transfers, the bonus will be
completely removed.

7. In order to simplify the calculations, the trading account to which the bonus has been
applied, will be blocked for outgoing internal transfers to other accounts of the client.

8. In exceptional circumstances, in the form of a special offer, the bonus amount may reach
up to 500%.

9. In case the company believes that the bonus is used for illegal purposes, the firm has the
right to cancel the bonus issued, as well as transactions on the trading account, on which the
bonus has been credited.

Depositing and withdrawing funds without commission

1. The ParadTrade platform offers its clients the service of depositing and withdrawing funds
without commissions.

2. The commission charged by the bank payment system is not compensated.

3. Fair usage policy applies to this promotion. The Company reserves the right to apply a
commission of 10.75% of the deposited amount and 6.5% of the withdrawn amount, but no
less than $50, to compensate the Company for the deposit and withdrawal costs. In case,
between deposit and withdrawal, the client has not made transactions with total volume of
standard lots, equal to the amount of deposit divided by 200, which difference between
opening and closing price was at least 3 points.

Invite a Friend



1. ParadTrade platform offers its clients to recommend the company's services to other
users and receive a commission of 15% of the first deposit amount of the referred client's
account.

2. The commission is credited after the referred client has made the required minimum
trading turnover (total volume of closed transactions in standard lots equal to the deposit
sum divided by 20) and performed at least 50 closes of transactions. Only trades in currency
pairs, as well as gold and silver, where the difference between the opening and closing
prices is not less than three points, are taken into account when calculating the minimum
turnover.

3. Commission can be paid without reaching the minimum trading turnover if the client's
negative P/L on trading accounts was 95% or more of the deposited amount, but not earlier
than 30 days after making a deposit to the account.

4. In case of depositing using bank cards or any other high-risk methods, the commission
will be paid only after the attracted client has undergone the complete identity verification
procedure.

5. In connection with high risk of illegal use, the company has the right to demand to pass
the procedure of confirmation of identity to the referrer, before making charge or payment of
commission to him.

Insurance against losing trades

1. Under the terms of this promotion, the Client's selected trades are insured against a
negative result. If a deal has a negative result, the funds are compensated to the balance of
the user's trading account.

2. You can participate in this promotion only after your personal manager confirms it.

The promotion applies only to deals, which were agreed upon with a personal manager. 4.

4. Insurance only applies to clients who confirmed their participation in advance.

5. Insurance is credited to the total amount of losses calculated on the basis of all selected
trades.

6. Refunds for a deposit within this promotion are treated as a bonus and may be withdrawn
from the account only provided that the minimum trading volume requirement is met: 1
standard lot of closed trades for each $20 of bonus funds. Only trades with a minimum 3
point difference between opening and closing prices are taken into account. In case of
withdrawal of any amount from the account, all returned funds not covered by the minimum
trading volume will be deducted from the account.

7. If the compensation received is not used in trading for three consecutive months, the
accrued funds or their unused balance will be withdrawn from the account after one year
from the accrual of compensation.



8. A deposit of at least $5000.0 is required to take part in the promotion.

Bonus up to 100% Trade Protect

Bonus is applied by your account manager, after the funds are credited, the amount of
deposit together with the bonus will be credited to your account. There is no limit on the
number of deposits to which the bonus can be applied.

2. 2) The amount of bonus depends on the amount credited as follows: a 25% bonus is
credited for amounts from $250 to $4999, a 50% bonus is credited for amounts from $5000
to $19999, a 75% bonus is credited for amounts from $20000 to $4999 and a 100% bonus is
credited for amounts over $50000.

3) Bonus can be used for real trading, it participates in drawdown and is equal to real money.

4. Bonus can be lost during trading.

5. Bonus up to 100% for deposit is intended to increase trading activity. Bonus will be
deducted from the account after one year, if not used in full by then.

6. If you withdraw from your account, including an internal transfer, the bonus will be
completely removed.

7. In order to simplify the calculations, the trading account to which the bonus has been
applied, will be blocked for outgoing internal transfers to other accounts of the client.

8. 8. In case the company believes that the bonus is used for unlawful purposes, the
company has the right to cancel the bonus, as well as transactions on the trading account,
on which the bonus was credited.

9. Fair usage policy is applied to this promotion. The company has the right to apply a
commission in the amount of 10.75% of the deposited amount and 6.5% of the withdrawn
amount, but no less than $100, for compensation of the lost profit of the company. In case,
between deposit and withdrawal, the client has not made transactions with the total volume
of standard lots, equal to the amount of deposit divided by 200, which difference between
opening and closing price was at least 3 points.

Cashback 10%.

1. ParadTrade invites its clients to use the cashback service of 10% of the deposited
amount.

2. According to the conditions of this promotion, 10% of the recharged amount is returned to
the client's card, and 10% of the recharged amount is credited to the trading account as a
compensation.



3. Cashback is credited within 48 hours after recharging the account on workdays.

4. Fair usage policy applies to this promotion. The Company reserves the right to apply a
commission of 10.75% of the deposited amount and 6.5% of the withdrawn amount, but no
less than $50, to compensate the Company for expenses incurred during deposit and
withdrawal. In case, between deposit and withdrawal, the Client has not made transactions
with total volume in standard lots, equal to the amount of deposit divided by 100, with the
difference of opening and closing prices of at least 3 points. 5.

5. 5. Compensation received under the promotion can be withdrawn from the client's account
only after the accumulation of trading volume on the account in the amount equal to 1
standard lot for each $1 of the received compensation.

6. It is forbidden to use the bonus to cheat the company in order to generate unlawful profit


